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Organized events

1. Malala day celebration

On the occasion of Malala Day on 12th July 2022 online declamation competition was
conducted for college students. About fifteen students participated in the competition. CDT
Asha Merlin SM of Kuttikanam Marian College bagged the first position and CDT Gauri

Nandana MG of Baselius College Kottayam bagged the second position in the competition.

https://instagram.com/mariancollege__ncc_?igshid=YmMyMTA2M2Y


Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/CRNrxVZFwTw/?igshid=YmMyMTA2M2Y=

2. Anti Plastic Day

On 12th July 2022 Marian College organized anti plastic day under the leadership of NCC
cadets. Along with sharing messages through posters and videos, paper bags made by cadets

were also distributed. 30 cadets were part of this programme.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/CfiQ3MiFq5m/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

3. Youth Skills Day Celebration

https://www.instagram.com/p/CRNrxVZFwTw/?igshid=YmMyMTA2M2Y
https://www.instagram.com/p/CfiQ3MiFq5m/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


On 15th July 2022, World Youth Skills Day was organized online under the leadership of
cadets. Students were given an opportunity to showcase their talents and interests and their

videos were posted on Marian College NCC's Instagram page.

InstagramLink:

https://www.instagram.com/p/CgBDBPsPQJO/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

4. Nelson Mandela Day Celebration

Posters were made in conjunction with Nelson Mandela Day, 18 July 2022. About fifty
students participated in the web talk organized by CDT Anna Maria Majo and CDT Megha

Maria Tom through Google Meet on 1st August 2022 to introduce the life of Nelson Mandela
to the students.

https://www.instagram.com/p/CgBDBPsPQJO/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


InstagramLink:

https://www.instagram.com/p/CgJQ6XKPls7/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

5. Kargil Day Celebration

In the webinar held in connection with Kargil Victory Day on 26th July 2022, Honorable
Retired Captain Shri K Soman with 30 years of Army service explained the history of Kargil

Day to the students. About sixty students participated in the webinar.

https://www.instagram.com/p/CgJQ6XKPls7/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


6. Indepedence 2021

74th Independence Day celebrations were organized. Students shared Independence Day
messages through posters, videos and photo collages.

7.  Hiroshima-Nagasaki Day



In the 2021 Hiroshima Nagasaki Day Webinar, Marian College MCMS Department Assistant
Professor Mr. Eppen Alexander spoke about World Wars 1-2 and the Hiroshima Nagasaki

atomic bomb disaster. 60 students participated in the webinar. CDT Sneha An Devasya and
CDT R Sariga won the 'Wakeyigu' online quiz competition conducted as part of the day

celebrations.

8.  NCC Day Celebration 2021

NCC Day 2021 was held on 28th November. Videos and pictures giving the concept of 'Run
For Health' were shared. And as part of the nature conservation message, saplings were

planted in the cadets' homes.



9. Tribute To Brave Jawans

NCC cadets of Marion College lit candles at their homes to pay their respects to India's first
Joint Chiefs of Staff General Shri Bipin Rawat, his wife Mrs. Mathulika Rawat and 12 other

soldiers who died in a helicopter crash at Coonoor, Tamil Nadu on 8th December 2021.

10. International Yoga Day



In connection with International Yoga Day 21 June 2022, NCC Cadets of Marian College
celebrated Yoga Day in College and Houses. Fifty nine students participated in the

competition. Pictures of the day were shared on social media

11 . Kargil Vijay Diwas Commemoration 2022



In connection with the commemoration of Kargil Victory Day on 26th July 2022, a class wise
tableau competition was organized for the students of Marian College. 2 Bcom C won the
first position and 2 Bcom B won the second position in the competition in which six teams
participated. Honorable Principal Dr Sri Ajimon George inaugurated the competition and

gave away the prizes.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/CghJLaGBlkr/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

12. Rainy Day Celebration

https://www.instagram.com/p/CghJLaGBlkr/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


The seminar was held on the theme 'Catch the Rain' on July 29 as part of the 2022 Rainy Day
celebrations. CPL Nimisha Aju conducted the seminar. Rain and rainwater conservation were

discussed in the seminar. Then a group discussion competition was organized for 2nd year
NCC cadets. 35 students participated in the seminar.

Instagram Link;

https://www.instagram.com/p/Cgk8gm-vXD2/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

13.  A mini marathon organized on the occasion of 75th Independence Day

On the occasion of 75th Independence Day, Marian College Health and Wellness Department
and NCC Unit organized a 5 KM Mini Marathon for the students of Marian College. The

competition was divided into separate categories for boys and girls. 90 students participated
in the competition. Honorable Principal Dr Sri Ajimon George inaugurated the competition

and gave away the prizes

https://www.instagram.com/p/Cgk8gm-vXD2/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChH3h7LvjfE/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

14. 'Har Ghar Thiranga' - Hoisting of flags at homes

On 14th August 2022 students of Marian College NCC Unit participated in the 'Har Ghar
Janda' campaign announced by Prime Minister Shri Narendra Modi on the occasion of 75th

Independence Day. Students organized flag hoisting and distribution at homes.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChH3h7LvjfE/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChH3h7LvjfE/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I
https://www.instagram.com/p/ChH3h7LvjfE/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


15 .  Online competitions conducted on the occasion of 75th Independence
Day



As part of sharing the message of Independence Day, Marion College NCC Unit organized
various online competitions for Marion College students. Around 30 students participated in
digital poster making competition, quiz competition and essay competition. Winners were

given e-certificates.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChcXt0wPNBu/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChccJf8vh6D/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

https://www.instagram.com/p/Chcd7puP6XN/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

16. Azadi Ka Amrit Maholsav @Marian

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChcXt0wPNBu/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I
https://www.instagram.com/p/ChccJf8vh6D/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I
https://www.instagram.com/p/Chcd7puP6XN/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


On 15th August 2022, the 75th Independence Day celebration was organized colorfully under
the leadership of Marian College NCC Unit. Hon'ble Principal Dr Sri Ajimon George

inaugurated the Independence Day Celebration 'Azadhi' and delivered the message. As part of
the celebration, a parade, path raising, rally, distribution of pamphlets, cleaning of college

premises, cleaning of Gandhi statue etc. were conducted. 50 NCC cadets participated in the
programs.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChTUPaQvWTL/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

17. Induction Program and Enrollment for First Year Students (2022)

https://www.instagram.com/p/ChTUPaQvWTL/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


Induction Program and Enrollment for first year students of Marian College was conducted
from 21-26 September 2022. Out of 65 students, 56 were selected for the 2022-25 batch. RM
Jagbir Singh, BHM Kannan MU and RIS Bhaskaran V led the enrollment at Marian College

Indoor Stadium.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/p/Cih2LZcJfUO/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

https://www.instagram.com/p/Cih2UZkJU74/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

18.Puneet Aagar Abhiyan

https://www.instagram.com/p/Cih2LZcJfUO/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I
https://www.instagram.com/p/Cih2UZkJU74/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


CPL Nimisha Aju shared the message which is part of the 'Puneet Sagar Abhiyan' campaign
announced by the Honorable Prime Minister Shri Narendra Modi in view of theneed to

protect river basins and other water resources. The video was also shared

Marian College NCC unit's Instagram page.

Instagram Link:

https://www.instagram.com/reel/Ci6ZZJfpPwH/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I=

19. Fundraising For The We-Care Fund

https://www.instagram.com/reel/Ci6ZZJfpPwH/?igshid=ZjA0NjI3M2I


The fundraising was done under the leadership of Marian College NCC Cadets, which was a
part of the 'V-Ker' cabin inaugurated in Thrissur by the Higher Education Minister Mrs. Dr.

R. Bindu, with the aim of providing medical assistance to needy families. Honorable
Principal Dr Sri Ajimon George inaugurated the college level cabin. 8,208 rupees were

collected in the effort from September 20 to 23, 2022. The amount was transferred to the
battalion.

20. Make the Kindest Cut' campaign

On 27th September 2022 'Make the Kindest Cut' campaign was organized by Marian College
NCC unit to collect hair for hair making for cancer patients. 8 college students participated in

the competition.

21. Senior Panel 2022-23



The senior panel for the 2022-23 operational year was selected on the basis of performances
at the CATC camp. SUO Esther Sunny, UO Keerthy Ravindranath, UO Megha Jose, UO

Twinkle Johnson, SGT Dellamol Joychan, SGT Nimisha Aju and SGT Anushamol KB are on
the panel.

22. Cleaning of Marian Check Dam



On 27th October 2022, 42 NCC cadets along with Marion NSS volunteers participated in
Marion College water source Chek Dam cleaning.

23. Ekta Day celebration at Kuttikanam 5 Kerala Police Camp

As part of Ekatha Day 2022 celebrations, 15 NCC cadets of Marian College along with CTO
Sonia Scaria arrived at Kuttikanam 5 Kerala Police Battalion Cab and participated in various
activities. The event was a great opportunity to learn more about the adventurous life of law

enforcers and interact with children from other schools.

24. Coffee distribution for Sabarimala Pilgrims



On 29th November, 2022 MVD(motor vehicle department) in association with NCC unit of
marian college, kuttikanam provided snacks and coffee for 150 sabarimala pilgrims.

14 NCC cadets were wholeheartedly participated and the event was held at 9:30 pm to
12:30pm.

25. Antinarcotics day campaign



The NCC unit of the Marian College Kuttikkanam held an anti-narcotics day

programme on 7th December 2022 to strengthen action and cooperation in

achieving the goal of a world free of drug abuse to eradicate and to raise

awareness to fight against drug abuse among youth. The programme was

held from 8.30 to 9.30 in 4 classes. These are Bcom, BBA, BCA and BSW

classes. The students have listened to it very attentively and the awareness

class is taken by NCC cadets. This 1-hour session is mainly interactive and

focuses on the issues of drug addiction like dependence and addiction,

injury and accidents, health problems and sleep issues. Many students ask

their doubts and get clear-cut ideas about these problems. Then explain

the effects of them on the life of individuals and how they badly affect

society.

Nowadays drug addiction is a very severe problem around the whole world.

So we thought of giving an awareness class in our college. This

programme was very successful to spread awareness among youth.

26. Blood donation camp



Marian college Kuttikkanam Autonomous under the joint auspices of units NCC and
NSS a collaboration with Thodupuzha IMA blood center,HDFC bank.a blood

donation camp was organized. Around 110 people volunteered to donate blood and
from them 30 were found fit to donate blood and it collected today. 28 NCC cadets
are actively participated in the volunteering duties. The camp started at 10.45 on 7

December 2022. All the blood doners who participated were given a water bottle as a
gift

27. Electoral Literacy Programme



An electoral literacy program was held in Marian College Kuttikkanam (Autonomous)on 13
th Dece mber 2022. The class was taken by Jeeva sir,Pramodh sir, Election clerk Vishnu sir

and election clerk KT Biju Sir from the peermde Election Commission Board. 60 NCC cadets
and NSS students actively participate in this session from 11 am to 12 am. This one-hour

session was very interactive and many cadets ask questions for doubt clearness. They
introduced a very useful app called Voter Helpine. For many students, it was the app they
were hearing for the first time. This session was mainly focused on the right of voting in

India. By voting, citizens are participating in the democratic process. Citizens vote for leaders
to represent them and their ideas, and the leaders support the citizens' interests. The right to

Vote is a Fundamental right of Indian Citizens. This session mainly focuses on Indian
Democracy and the Voting power of the Indian people.

28. HIV awareness programme



After the electoral literacy programme held an HIV awareness programme in Marian College
Kuttikkanam (Autonomous) on 13th December 2022 by the combined Kerala State Aids
Control Society and District Health Department. The session was taken by the Magician

Rajeev Memunda from 12 pm to 1.30 pm. For students, this is an entertainment session as
well as a useful session. This magic show gives a clear-cut idea about HIV disease and how
to spread this disease between people. HIV is caused by a virus. It can spread through sexual

contact, illicit injection drug use or sharing needles, contact with infected blood, or from
mother to child during pregnancy, childbirth or breastfeeding. These all are simply shown by

magic so that it is easy to understand.

Achievements



1. Winner of the collage making competition

In connection with Independence Day 2021, CDT Megha Jose of Kuttikanam Marian College
won first place in the 'Collage Making' competition organized by Ernakulam St. Albert's

College Autonomous 21 Kerala Battalion NCC.

2.  Victory in National Debating Competition

SGT Aparna S of Marian College Kuttikkanam NCC unit won the first position in the
Malayalam section of the National Debating Competition conducted by Baselius College

Kottayam NCC coy-ll, 16 Kerala Battalion.

3. E. B. S. B – Special National Integration Camp Srinagar



SGT Esther Sunny participated in EB SB – Special National Integration Camp conducted
from 15th to 26th June 2022 at Srinagar. 200 students from all over India participated in the

camp.

Camps attended



1. Firing Camp 2022

CDT Kirti Ravindranath, CDT Esther Sunny and CDT Megha Jose have been selected for the
firing team of 5 Kerala Girls Battalion for the year 2022. The cadets participated in the

Inter-Unit Competition held at Ranni St. Thomas College and the Pre-TSE Competition held
at Government College, Kattappana. The team consisting of CDT Keerthy Ravindranath and

CDT Megha Jose secured the fourth position in Pre-TSE.

2. C. A. T. C Camp @Pala Alphonsa College



44 students of Kuttikanam Marian College participated in the Combined Annual Training
Camp held at Pala Alphonsa College from October 1 to 8, 2022. The camp was a new

experience for the students ahead of the certificate exam. Marion College emerged victorious
in various competitions held as part of the camp. UO Keerthy Ravindranath and CPL Twinkle

Johnson were awarded for their outstanding performance in the medical team. UO Esther
Sunny was promoted as SUO during the rank up ceremony which was part of the camp.



3. C. A. T. C Camp @Pala Alphonsa College

CDT Anns Mariam Mathew has been selected for Camps One, Two and Three of the Pre-IGC
(Inter Group Competition) ahead of the 2023 Republic Day Parade. The camps were held in

the months of September and November 2022.

4. EBSB II KANNUR :

EBSB (Ek Bharat shresht Bharat”) . In NCC theEBSB camp held anually unity , nationalism
among the cadets , national integration and developing skills. The EBSB camp is one of the

prestigious camps where cadets  get to know the essence of India and its culture i.e.,
“unanimity is diversity”.

UO Keerthy  Ravindranath and SGT Dellamol Joychen has been selected for EBSB II
KANNUR conducted by Kerala & Lakshadweep DTE Madhya Pradesh and Chattisgarh

DTE. They had successfully participated and was a great appreciationing.



5. ARMY ATTATCHMENT CAMP:

In connection with Army Attatchment Camp held at Pangodu TVM (11 Madras Regiment )
CDT Anliya Joseph and CDT Albiya. A  participaed succesfully with great pride and

enthusiasm .

6. Advanced Leadership Camp



Advanced Leadership Camp was attended by CQMS Liyamol Lalan in the year 2021. The
camp took place in Coimbatore, Tamil Nadu.

Extra Achievement

1. Winners of State Kick Boxing Competition

CDT Nimisha Aju, CDT Megha Jose, CDT Twinkle Johnson, CDT Ierin Tessa Joseph, who
participated in the state amateur kickboxing competition held at Kozhikode Indoor Stadium

on 6th October 2021, represented Idukki district and won gold.

2. Winners of the National Kick Boxing Competition



The students of Marian College NCC Unit won the WACO India National Seniors and
Masters Kick Boxing Championship held in Chennai in the month of August 2022. SGT

Megha Maria Jose, CPL Nimisha Aju, CDT Ierin Tessa Joseph and CDT Sandra Ravindranad
won the medals.

3. Open International Kickboxing Championship



UO Twinkle Johnson represented the country in the India Open International Kickboxing
Championship held at Talkathora Stadium, Delhi from 2nd to 6th November 2022. Sport

talent from all over the world had come to compete.

4. National Karate Championship 2023

CDT Anju Augustine had actively participated on national level karate championship 2023
held in Tamil Nadu and achieved 1st prize for the same. It was a great pride and motivation

for all the cadets.



Certificate  Examinations

1. NCC 'C' Certificate Exam 2021-2022



Out of 10 cadets of Marian College who appeared for the NCC C Certificate Examination
2021, four scored 'A' grade and six scored 'B' grade. SUO Honey Sebastian, CPL Elizabeth

Roy, CPL Drishya Das and LCPL Jeffrina Jayaraj secured 'A' grade. Out of 23 cadets of
Marian College who appeared for the NCC C Certificate Examination 2022, 22 passed and

scored excellent marks

2. NCC B Certificate 2022-2023

21 cadets from Marian college unit appeared for B certificate examination for the year 2022.
the cadets were under the guidence of  CPL Anabel Denny..

3. NCC B Certificate 2022-2023

30 cadets from Marian college unit appeared for B certificate examination for the year 2023.
the cadets were under the guidence of CTO Sonia Scaria and CPL Anns Mariam.

Camps Organized



1. N. C. C 'B' Certificate Cader 2021

5- Kerala Girls Battalion NCC's 'B' Certificate Camp was conducted at Marian College,
Kuttikanam. 107 cadets from Marian College, Pala Alphonsa College, Kottayam BCM
College and Changanassery Assumption College participated in the camp. Mrs. Melbi

Joseph, CTO of Marion College, led the activities of the camp.The unveiling of the new
Gandhi statue at Marian College was held as part of Kottayam Group Commander Brigadier

M N Sajan's visit to the camp.

2. ATC camp 2022



ATC cum TSC camp was organised at Marian college in the year of 2022. Interbattalion
competition took place for varrious activites like field signals, tent pitching and so on.


